

CITY OF ASHEBORO CHEMICAL BID TABULATION MARCH 17, 2020

Company Name	Liquid Alum	Liquid Caustic	Floulsilic Acid	Sodium Hypochlorite 12%	Calcium Nitrate	Sodium Permanganate	Magnesium Hydroxide
Brenntag Mid-South NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$454.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
C & S Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	\$286.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemrite, Inc. NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.45	\$8.28	No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC NSF CERT (X)	\$333.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Evoqua Water Technologies NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.360	No Bid	No Bid
GEO Specialty Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	\$430.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Harcross Chemicals NSF CERT ()	No Bid	\$520.00	No Bid	\$0.63*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$460.00	No Bid	\$0.618*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lime-Chem, Inc. NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.23*	No Bid	No Bid
Oltrin Solutions LLC NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$424.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pencco, Inc NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	\$357.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Polytech, Inc NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.88
Premier Magnesia, LLC NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.77
Shannon Chemical NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	\$747.47	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.17	No Bid
Univar, USA, Inc NSF CERT (X)	\$292.00	\$409.00	\$376.00	\$0.68	\$2.09*	No Bid	No Bid
MINIMUM RESPONSIVE BID	\$286.00	\$409.00	\$357.00	\$0.68	\$2.36	\$8.17	\$1.88
MAXIMUM BID	\$430.14	\$520.00	\$747.47	\$0.68	\$2.45	\$8.28	\$2.77

* - Non Responsive Bid does not meet specifications

Recommended Bid Award

Revised 3-31-2020