

CITY OF ASHEBORO CHEMICAL BID TABULATION MARCH 12, 2019

Company Name	Liquid Alum	Liquid Caustic	Floussilic Acid	Sodium Hypochlorite 12%	Calcium Nitrate	Sodium Permanganate	Magnesium Hydroxide	ADD # 1
Amerochem Corporation NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.39	No Bid	Yes
Brenntag Mid-South NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	\$553.00	No Bid	\$0.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
C & S Chemicals NSF CERT (x)	\$286.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Chemrite, Inc. NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.37	No Bid	Yes
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC NSF CERT (x)	\$309.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Evoqua Water Technologies NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.439	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
GEO Specialty Chemicals NSF CERT (x)	\$415.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
JCI Jones Chemicals NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	\$583.00	No Bid	\$0.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Lime-Chem, Inc. NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.95	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Oltrin Solutions LLC NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	\$570.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Pencco, Inc NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	\$323.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Polytec, Inc NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.88	Yes
Shannon Chemical NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	\$717.17	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.34	No Bid	Yes
United Mineral & Chemical NSF CERT (x)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.48	No Bid	Yes
Univar, USA, Inc NSF CERT (x)	\$293.00	\$593.00	\$329.00	\$0.67	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.98	No
MINIMUM BID	\$286.00	\$553.00	\$323.75	\$0.6600	\$1.95	\$8.34	\$1.88	
MAXIMUM BID	\$415.14	\$593.00	\$717.17	\$0.8100	\$2.44	\$10.48	\$2.98	