

**CITY OF ASHEBORO
CHEMICAL BID TABULATION
MARCH 15, 2016**

Company Name	Liquid Alum	Liquid Caustic	Floussilcic Acid	Sodium Hypochlorite 12%	Calcium Nitrate
Brenntag Mid-South NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$414.73	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.63
C & S Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	\$386.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC NSF CERT (X)	\$263.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Evoqua Water Technologies NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5857
GEO Specialty Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	\$400.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lime-Chem NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5480
JCI Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$408.00	No Bid	\$0.58	No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mosaic Fishhawk NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	\$453.00	No Bid	No Bid
Pencoco, Inc NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	\$407.00	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	\$607.67	No Bid	No Bid
USALCO NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Univar, USA, Inc NSF CERT (X)	\$254.00	\$456.15	\$367.45	\$0.5700	No Bid

MINIMUM BID	\$254.00	\$408.00	\$367.45	\$0.5700	\$0.5480
MAXIMUM BID	\$400.14	\$456.15	\$607.67	\$0.5800	\$0.634