

**CITY OF ASHEBORO  
CHEMICAL BID TABULATION  
MARCH 17, 2015**

Company Name	Liquid Alum	Liquid Caustic	Floussilicic Acid	Sodium Hypochlorite 12%	Calcium Nitrate
Brenntag Mid-South NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	\$424.00	No Bid	\$0.7264	*
				\$0.6842	**
C & S Chemicals NSF CERT ( X )	\$386.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC NSF CERT ( X )	\$245.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
DOer Products & Services NSF CERT ( )	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.6600
Evoqua Water Technologies NSF CERT ( )	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5771
GEO Specialty Chemicals NSF CERT ( X )	\$385.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JCI Chemicals NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	\$456.00	No Bid	\$0.60	No Bid
Key Chemicals, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	No Bid	\$483.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mosaic Fishhawk NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	No Bid	\$563.00	No Bid	No Bid
Pencoco, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	No Bid	\$459.50	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	\$567.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
USALCO NSF CERT ( )	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Univar, USA, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	\$279.30	\$461.70	No Bid	\$0.5590	No Bid

MINIMUM BID	\$245.00	\$424.00	\$459.50	\$0.5590	\$0.5771
MAXIMUM BID	\$386.00	\$567.67	\$563.00	\$0.7264	\$0.660

\* Based on 4,000 gallon load

\*\* Based on 4,500 gallon load