

**CITY OF ASHEBORO
CHEMICAL BID TABULATIONS
3-15-2012**

Company Name	Liquid Alum	Liquid Caustic	Fluosilicic Acid	Sodium Hypochlorite	Calcium Nitrate
Amerochem Corporation NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	\$0.249*
Brenntag Southeast NSF CERT (X)	\$363.00	\$518.00	\$556.00	\$0.815	\$0.3114*
General Chemicals, LLC NSF CERT (X)	\$333.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Geo Specialty Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	\$437.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Harcros Chemical, Inc NSF CERT ()	\$462.00	\$533.00	\$616.00	No Bid	No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$554.00	No Bid	\$0.97	No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Key Chemicals, Inc NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$ 518.73	\$ 562.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mosiac NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 603.00	No Bid	No Bid
Seimens Water Technologies NSF CERT ()	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5626
Univar USA NSF CERT (X)	No Bid	\$ 531.00	No Bid	\$ 0.81	No Bid
NSF CERT ()					
MINIMUM BID	\$333.00	\$518.00	\$556.00	\$0.8100	\$0.5626
MAXIMUM BID	\$462.00	\$554.00	\$616.00	\$0.9700	\$0.5626

* Non-responsive - Miscalculation