

**CITY OF ASHEBORO  
CHEMICAL BID TABUATIONS  
3-15-2011**

Company Name	Liquid Alum	Liquid Caustic	Fluosilicic Acid	Sodium Hypochlorite	Potassium Permanganate	Hydrated Lime	Calcium Nitrate
Brenntag Southeast NSF CERT ( X )	\$336.00	\$478.59	\$566.00	\$ 0.790	No Bid	\$ 0.049	\$ 1.899
General Chemicals NSF CERT ( X )	\$309.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Geo Specialty Chemicals NSF CERT ( X )	\$437.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	\$449.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	\$425.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Key Chemicals, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	\$523.00	\$587.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mosiac Crop Nutrition, LLC NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	No Bid	\$700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Polytech, Inc NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.0449	No Bid
Seimens Water Technologies NSF CERT ( )	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.8850 1.98
Univar USA NSF CERT ( X )	No Bid	\$ 532.00	\$ 572.00	\$ 0.84	\$ 3.25	\$ 0.0445	No Bid
MINIMUM BID	\$309.90	\$449.00	\$566.00	\$0.7900	\$3.2500	\$0.0445	\$1.8850
MAXIMUM BID	\$437.08	\$532.00	\$700.00	\$0.8400	\$3.2500	\$0.0490	\$1.9800

\*\* (Bid Received Late)

\* \*\* (Conditional Bid)

\* Alternate Bid for 66% Solution Product

\*\* Non-responsive