
AGENDA 
REGULAR MEETING 

CITY COUNCIL, CITY OF ASHEBORO 
THURSDAY, APRIL 7, 2016, 7:00 PM 

 
1.        Call to order. 
 
2. Silent prayer and pledge of allegiance. 
 
3. Mayor Smith will present Ms. Lisa York, who is a National Auctioneers 

Association Ambassador, with a proclamation recognizing April 16, 2016, as 
National Auctioneers Day in Asheboro. 

 
4. Consent Agenda: 
 
 (a) Approval of the minutes of the city council’s special meeting on February 
  25, 2016. 
 

(b)  Approval of the minutes of the city council’s regular meeting on March 
10, 2016. 

  
(c) Acknowledgement of the receipt of the minutes of the Asheboro ABC 
Board’s meeting on February 1, 2016. 
 
(d)  Approval of ordinances submitted by the finance department: 
 
 (i)   General Fund Amendment; 

(ii)  Water & Sewer Fund Amendment; and 
(iii) Economic Development and Tourism Fund Amendment for  

         the New Century Drive Extension Project. 
 

(e)  Acknowledgement and announcement of the 15-day notice of a 
construction project to install clean-outs on sewer service lines in the 
following street locations: 

  
  (i)   Thornsdale Dr. between W. Beasley St. and Tremont Dr.; 
  (ii)  Dixon Ave. between S. McCrary St. and S. Cherry St.; and 
  (iii) Behind 1561 Shady Dr. 
 
   5. Public hearing (Legislative Zoning Case RZ-16-03) with Community  
 Development Director Trevor Nuttall presenting the staff’s analysis of the 

application by James P. Maness and Patricia B. Maness to rezone property 
 at 602 East Dixie Drive from R15  (Low-Density Residential) to B2 
 (General Commercial).    
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6. Public hearing on an annexation petition with City Engineer Michael 

Leonard, PE presenting the staff’s analysis of the request from Habitat for 
Humanity for the annexation of 0.638 acres located at 832 Peachtree Street. 
 

7. Public comment period. 
 
8. Water Resources Director Michael Rhoney, PE will present an analysis,  
 including certain recommendations, pertaining to the bids received for the  
 supply of  five chemicals to the water and wastewater treatment plants. 
  
9. Zoning Administrator/Planner Justin Luck will discuss the city’s selection as 

a finalist for the All-America City Award and the next steps in the process. 
 
10. Public Works Director David Hutchins will present the reorganization plan 
 regarding changes in the Street and Environmental Services Departments. 
 
11. City Engineer Michael Leonard, PE will report that the NC Department of 
 Transportation Division of Aviation has programmed $562,000 for the  
 construction of a new terminal building at the Asheboro Regional Airport. 
 
12. Mayor Smith will present Finance Officer Debbie Reaves the Government  
 Finance Officers Association Award for excellence in financial reporting. 
 
13.  Upcoming events: 
 

• Annual Wellness Fair at the Public Works Conference Room, Wednesday, 
April 13, 2016, 10:30 AM - 2:00 PM. 

• City Council workshop at the Public Works Conference Room, Thursday, 
April 21, 2016, 5:30 PM. 

• Identity Theft Prevention Program Committee, City Council Chambers, 
Wednesday, April 27, 2016, 9:00 AM. 

• Chamber of Commerce No Tie Affair at the NC Zoo Solar Pointe Plaza, 
Saturday, April 30, 2016, 6:00 PM to 10:00 PM. 

• Mayor's Prayer Breakfast at AVS Banquet Center, Thursday, May 5, 
2016, 6:45 AM. 
 

14. Items not on the agenda. 
 
15. Adjournment. 
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ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT FUND  
FY 2015-2016 

 

1 of 2 
 

 
WHEREAS, the needs of the City of Asheboro have evolved as the economic environment has 
changed over the last decade, and;  
 
WHEREAS, historically, the term “Economic Development” for the City of Asheboro City Council 
meant a) support of agency efforts that promote the City of Asheboro and b) financial incentive 
support to expanding industries that are committed to job development and c) water & sewer 
infrastructure expansion projects, and; 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Asheboro City Council, the Randolph County Board of Commissioners, and 
the Randolph County Economic Development Corporation have all identified the need for "shovel 
ready" industrial sites, and; 
 
WHEREAS, these "shovel ready" industrial sites should have water, wastewater, broadband 
communications and natural gas services at the site, and;  
 
WHEREAS, these  "shovel ready" industrial sites should have ease of access to the interstate 
highway system, and; 
 
WHEREAS, the extension of New Century Drive to Veterans Loop Road would create "shovel ready" 
industrial sites that have water, wastewater, broadband communications and natural gas services at 
the site, as well as ease of access to the interstate highway system, and; 
 
WHEREAS, POST MOM Brands has advised the City of Asheboro and the County of Randolph that 
they will not be asking for their economic incentive payment for 2015-2016, and; 
 
WHEREAS, the Randolph County Board of Commissioners will financially participate in this project by 
reallocating the $197,500 the Board has appropriated to POST MOM Brands to the City of Asheboro 
to construct the New Century Drive Extension, and; 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Asheboro City Council wishes to financially participate in this project by 
reallocating the $197,500 the City Council has appropriated to POST MOM Brands to construct  the 
New Century Drive Extension, and; 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Asheboro desires to be in compliance with all generally accepted accounting 
principles, and; 
 
THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ASHEBORO, NORTH 
CAROLINA: 
 
That the following Revenue line items be increased / decreased:  
 

Line Item Description 

 

Appropriated 
Amount 

  
72-367-1033 Contribution to Malt-O-Meal #9 (15-16) (197,500) 
72-373-0001 City of Asheboro Contribution for New Century Drive Extension 197,500 
72-373-0002 County of Randolph Contribution for New Century drive 197,500 
 Increase $197,500 

 

tnuttall
Typewritten Text
Item 4 (d)

tnuttall
Typewritten Text

tnuttall
Typewritten Text



ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT FUND  
FY 2015-2016 

 

2 of 2 
 

 
 
That the following expense line items be increased / decreased:  
 
Line Item Description 

 

Appropriated 
Amount 

  
72-860-0023 Contribution to Malt-O-Meal #9 (15-16) (197,500) 
72-813-0001 Construction of New Century Drive 334,500 
72-813-0002 Professional Engineering Services for New Century Drive 60,500 

       Increase $197,500 
 
 
Adopted this the 7th day of April 2016. 
 
  
  __________________________ 
   David H. Smith, Mayor  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Holly H Doerr, CMC, NCCMC, City Clerk 



 

 
 

RZ-16-03: Rezone from R15 (Low-Density Residential) to B2 (General 

Commercial) 

 

(602 East Dixie Drive) 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Planning Board Recommendation and Staff Report 
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Planning Board Recommendation & Comments to City Council

NOTE: Have applicant Certify to Council mailings to all adjoining property owners.

3-7-2016Case # RZ-16
-03

Date

Applicant James P. Maness and Patricia B. Maness
Legal Description

The property of James F. Maness and Patricia B. Maness, located at 602 East Dixie Drive, totaling
approximately 0.749 acres (+/-) and more specifically identified by Randolph County Parcel
Identification Number 7760066689.

Requested Action Rezone from R15 (Low-Density Residential) to B2 (General
Commercial)

Land Development Plan  See rezoning staff report

Existing Zone R15 (Low-Density Residential)

Planning Board Recommendation
Approve

Reason for Recommendation

The Planning Board concurred with staff reasoning.

Planning Board Comments



 Rezoning Staff Report

Applicant's Reasons as stated on application

RZ Case # RZ-16-03

General Information
Applicant James P. Maness and Patricia B. Maness

Address PO Box 352
Asheboro NC 27204City

Phone 336-318-9139 or 336-953-0749
602 East Dixie DriveLocation

Requested
  Action Rezone from R15 (Low-Density Residential) to B2 (General Commercial)

B2/R15Existing Zone Existing Land Use Eating Establishment (restaurant)

Size 0.749 acres total (+/-)

With continued growth on US Hwy. 64/Dixie Drive, the highest and best use of this property is B-2. Requesting
entire tract be zoned B-2. The property Land Use Map designates the entire property as commercial. Majority of
property is zoned B-2 on which the Golden Waffle has operated since 1974. A change to all B-2 allows for
optimal use of the property to its fullest extent.

Surrounding Land Use
North Commercial East Commercial

Single-family residential West CommercialSouth

N/AZoning History

Legal Description
The property of James F. Maness and Patricia B. Maness, located at 602 East Dixie Drive, totaling approximately 0.749 
acres (+/-) and more specifically identified by Randolph County Parcel Identification Number 7760066689.

7760066689 (portion)Pin #

4/7/2016 City CouncilDate

1. The property is inside the city limits. All city services are available.
2. East Dixie Drive is a state-maintained boulevard. Cliff Road is a city-maintained collector street.
3. Approximately 0.19 acres of the property is zoned R15. This portion of the property is requested for the
rezoning.
4. The adjoining land uses include commercial to the north, east, and west and residential uses to the south.
Buffer/screening requirements (consisting of landscaping and/or fences) between the existing/future commercial
uses and adjoining residential property will likely apply (depending on the specific use or activity proposed).
5. There is currently an eating establishment (restaurant) on the property.
6. The rezoning is a general district request and would allow all uses permitted by right in the B2 (General
Commercial) zoning district. 

Analysis



 Rezoning Staff Report

Page 2
RZ Case # RZ-16-03

Primary GrowthGrowth Strategy Map Designation

Checklist Item 1:  Rezoning is compliant with the Proposed Land Use Map.

Checklist Item 5: The proposed rezoning is compliant with the growth strategy map

Checklist Item 7: The proposed rezoning is compatible with the applicable Small Area Plan

Checklist Items 12, 13, 14, and 15:   12.) Property is located outside of watershed  13.) The
property is located outside of Special Hazard Flood Area.  14.) Rezoning is not located on 
steep slopes of greater than 20%. 15.) Rezoning is not located on poor soils

  LDP Goals/Policies Which Support Request

CommercialProposed Land Use Map Designation

Consistency with the 2020 LDP Growth Strategy designations
In reviewing this request, careful consideration is given to each Goal and Policy as outlined in
the Land Development Plan.  Some Goals and Policies will either support or will not support the
request, while others will be neutral or will not apply.  Only those Goals and Policies that support
or do not support the request will be shown.

  Small Area Plan Central



 Rezoning Staff Report

Recommendation In light of the above analysis, staff's recommendation is approval of this request.

The City will ensure development regulations provide appropriate transitional land uses, such as 
office & institutional, between high-intensity industrial/commercial & low-intensity residential uses.

Policy 2.1.5

RZ-16-03RZ Case # Page 3

Staff's Final Analysis Concerning Consistency with Adopted Comprehensive Plans, Reasonableness and Public Interest

The requested amendment (rezoning the property from R15 Low-Density Residential to B2 General Commercial) is
consistent with the Land Development Plan because the proposed land use map designates the property as
"Commercial", and the Central Small Area Plan proposes accommodating existing commercial uses and allowing
some future commercial uses.

The requested rezoning to B2 is also reasonable and in the public interest because the B2 district is appropriate to
the property's context.  First, rezoning the portion of the property that is currently zoned R15 to B2 will allow
uniform use of a parcel in which the majority is already commercially zoned. Second, the parcel is located along an
established commercial corridor (East Dixie Dr.), the majority of which is also designated for commercial use by
the Land Development Plan. Third, the property's location in the primary growth strategy area (with access to city
services) and away from major environmental limitations, such as flood hazard areas or watershed areas, are
conducive to commercial development characterized by the B2 district. Finally, the review process required for 
future development will ensure that buffering/screening and other requirements help mitigate potential impacts of
commercial property onto adjoining residentially zoned property.

  LDP Goals/Policies Which Do Not Support Request
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CITY OF ASHEBORO 

CHEMICAL BID TABULATION 

MARCH 15, 2016

Liquid Liquid Flousilcic Sodium Calcium
Alum Caustic Acid Hypochlorite 12% Nitrate

Brenntag Mid-South

NSF CERT ( X   )

C & S Chemicals

NSF CERT ( X   )

Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC

NSF CERT (  X  )

Evoqua Water Technologies

NSF CERT (    )

GEO Specialty Chemicals

NSF CERT (  X  )

Lime-Chem

NSF CERT (  X  )

JCI Chemicals

NSF CERT (  X  )

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc

NSF CERT (  X  )

Mosaic Fishhawk

NSF CERT (  X  )

Pencco, Inc

NSF CERT (  X  )

Shannon Chemical

NSF CERT (  X  )

USALCO

NSF CERT (    )

Univar, USA, Inc

NSF CERT (  X  )

MINIMUM BID $254.00 $408.00 $367.45 $0.5700 $0.5480
MAXIMUM BID $400.14 $456.15 $607.67 $0.5800 $0.634

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$254.00 $456.15 $367.45 $0.5700 No Bid

No Bid No Bid $607.67 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $407.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $453.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid$0.58No Bid$408.00No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.5480

No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$400.14

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.5857

$263.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$386.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Company Name

No Bid $414.73 No Bid No Bid $0.63
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